
WATER RESOURCES VARIOUS CHEMICALS  BID TAB

November 2, 2016    2:00PM

Bidder Morton Salt SNF Polydyne Sal JCI Jones Bonded Chem Barber's Chem Kemiera Thatcher Co ShannonChem

Bond Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Check

1A Southern Rock Salt 25 Ton Truck Load. Shalersvilles Unit $120.22 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Southern Rock Salt 25 Ton Truck Load. Shalersvilles Total $180,330 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

2 Chlorine  Brimfield WTP location 150 LB No Bid No Bid No Bid $64.00 $85.50 $79.000 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Chlorine  Brimfield WTP location total No Bid No Bid No Bid $1,024.00 $1,368.00 $1,264.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid

3 Hydrofluosilicic Acid 30 Gal Drums of H2SiF6 unit No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $76.80/$.256lb No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Hydrofluosilicic Acid 30 Gal Drums of H2SiF6 total No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $7,680.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Hydrofluosilicic Acid Shalersville WTP No Bid No Bid $79.33 No Bid $76.80 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Hydrofluosilicic Acid Shalersville WTP total No Bid No Bid $3,966.50 No Bid $3,840.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Hydrofluosilicic Acid Brimfield WTP No Bid No Bid $79.33 No Bid $76.80 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Hydrofluosilicic Acid Brimfield WTP total No Bid No Bid $3,966.50 No Bid $3,840.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

4A Sodium Hypochlorite 12.5% concentration Shalersville Unit Cost No Bid No Bid $1,930/.995 gal .857gal $1,670.00/.835gal $1.04 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Sodium Hypochlorite 12.5% concentration Shalersville total No Bid No Bid $25,090.00 $22,620.00 $21,710.00 $27,040.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid

4B Sodium Hypochlorite 12.5% concentration Brimfield Unit Cost No Bid No Bid $995/.995 gal $1.03 gal $985/.985 gal $1.04 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Sodium Hypochlorite 12.5% concentration Brimfield Total No Bid No Bid $5,970.00 $6,180.00 $5,910.00 $6,240.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid

4C Sodium Hypochlorite 12.5% concentration 15 Gal Carboy Containers unit No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $26.25/ $1.75 gal No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Sodium Hypochlorite 12.5% concentration 15 Gal Carboy Containers total No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $918.75 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Sodium Hypochlorite 12.5% concentration Suffield CTW Unit cost No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $26.25 $38.40/ 15 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Sodium Hypochlorite 12.5% concentration Suffield WTP  total No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $525.00 $768.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Sodium Hypochlorite 12.5% concentration  Randolph WWTP CTW Unit cost No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $26.25 $38.40/15 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Sodium Hypochlorite 12.5% concentration  Randolph WWTP total No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $393.75 $576.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid

5 Citric Acit 50% concentration Randolph WWTP unit No Bid No Bid $197.60 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $183.33

Citric Acit 50% concentration Randolph WWTP total No Bid No Bid $1,976.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1,833.30

Citric Acit 50% concentration Franklin & Kent WWTP unit No Bid No Bid $197.60 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $183.33

Citric Acit 50% concentration Franklin & Kent WWTP total No Bid No Bid $1,976.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1,833.30
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6 Potassium Permanganate Shalersville WTP unit No Bid No Bid $123.48 No Bid $104.00/2.08lb $127.79 each No Bid $123.00 $124.25

Potassium Permanganate Shalersville WTP total No Bid No Bid $2,348.00 No Bid $10,400.00 $12,779.00 No Bid $12,300.00 $12,424.00

7 Sodium Bisulfite 38% concentration Shalersville WTP unit No Bid No Bid $33.30 No Bid $29.85/.199 lb No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Sodium Bisulfite 38% concentration Shalersville WTP total No Bid No Bid $2,331.00 No Bid $2,089.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

8 Sodium Bisulfite 38% concentration O&M facility Ravenna twp. Lb No Bid No Bid $119.92 No Bid $128.25/$2.85 lb $127.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Sodium Bisulfite 38% concentration O&M facility Ravenna twp. total No Bid No Bid $1,798.80 No Bid $1,923.75 $1,912.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid

9A Ferric Chloride 38% 4,000 gal bulk Delivery Unit No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $3,828.12 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Ferric Chloride 38% 4,000 gal bulk Delivery Total No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $84,218.64 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Ferric Chloride 38% Streetsboro WWTP  4000 gal unit No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid See notes No Bid $5,720.00 No Bid No Bid

Ferric Chloride 38% Streetsboro WWTP 4000 gal total No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid See notes No Bid $125,840.00 No Bid No Bid

Ferric Chloride 38%  Franklin Hills WWTP 4000 gal unit No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid See notes No Bid $5,720.00 No Bid No Bid

Ferric Chloride 38%  Franklin Hills WWTP 4000 gal total No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid See notes No Bid $125,840.00 No Bid No Bid

9B Ferric Chloride 38% - 42% Streetsboro WWTP 4000 gal unit No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Ferric Chloride 38% - 42% Streetsboro WWTP 4000 gal total No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Ferric Chloride 38% - 42% Franklin Hills WWTP 4000 gal total No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Ferric Chloride 38% - 42% Franklin Hills WWTP 4000 gal total No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

9C Ferric Chloride 38% 4000 Gal Bulk Delivery unit No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $3,933.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Ferric Chloride 38% 4000 Gal Bulk Delivery Total No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $11,799.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

9C -1 Ferric Chloride 38% - Boling Brooks WWTP Unit No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid See notes No Bid $5,720.00 No Bid No Bid

Ferric Chloride 38% - Boling Brooks WWTP Total No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid See notes No Bid $17,160.00 No Bid No Bid

9C-2 Ferric Chloride 38% - Red Fox WWTP Unit No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid See notes No Bid $5,720.00 No Bid No Bid

Ferric Chloride 38% - Red Fox WWTP Total No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid See notes No Bid $17,160.00 No Bid No Bid

9C-3 Ferric Chloride 38% - Atwater WWTP Unit No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid See notes No Bid $5,720.00 No Bid No Bid

Ferric Chloride 38% - Atwater WWTP Total No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid See notes No Bid $17,160.00 No Bid No Bid

9D-1 Ferric Chloride 38% - Boling Brooks WWTP Unit No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Ferric Chloride 38% - Boling Brooks WWTP Total No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

9D-2 Ferric Chloride 38% - Red Fox WWTP Unit No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Ferric Chloride 38% - Red Fox WWTP Total No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

9D-3 Ferric Chloride 38% - Atwater WWTP Unit No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Ferric Chloride 38% - Atwater WWTP Total No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
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9E Ferric Chloride 55 Gal Drum Atwater WWTP unit No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $116.00/ .20 lb No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Ferric Chloride 55 Gal Drum Atwater WWTP total No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1,508.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

9F Ferric Chloride 55 Gal Drum Atwater WWTP unit No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Ferric Chloride 55 Gal Drum Atwater WWTP total No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

9G Ferric Tank Cleanings Product Disposal Streetsboro /Franklin Hills WWTP unit No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $15,000.00 No Bid No Bid

Ferric Tank Cleanings Product Disposal Streetsboro /Franklin Hills WWTP total No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $45,000.00 No Bid No Bid

9G-1 Ferric Tank Cleanings Blend Existing Ferrric Streetsboro /Franklin Hills WWTP unit No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $2,500.00 No Bid No Bid

Ferric Tank Cleanings Blend Existing Ferrric Streetsboro /Franklin Hills WWTP total No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $7,500.00 No Bid No Bid

9H Ferric Tank Cleanings Product Disposal Boilingbrooks WWTP unit No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $15,000.00 No Bid No Bid

Ferric Tank Cleanings Product Disposal Boilingbrooks WWTP total No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $15,000.00 No Bid No Bid

9H-1 Ferric Tank Cleanings Blend Existing Boilingbrooks WWTP total No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $2,500.00 No Bid No Bid

Ferric Tank Cleanings Blend Existing Boilingbrooks WWTP unit No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $2,500.00 No Bid No Bid

9I Ferric Tank Cleanings Product Disposal Red Fox WWTP unit No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $15,000.00 No Bid No Bid

Ferric Tank Cleanings Product Disposal Red Fox WWTP total No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $15,000.00 No Bid No Bid

9I-1 Ferric Tank Cleanings Blend Existing Red Fox WWTP unit No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $2,500.00 No Bid No Bid

Ferric Tank Cleanings Blend Existing Red Fox WWTP total No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $2,500.00 No Bid No Bid

9J Ferric Tank Cleanings Product Disposal Atwater WWTP unit No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $15,000.00 No Bid No Bid

Ferric Tank Cleanings Product Disposal Atwater WWTP total No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $15,000.00 No Bid No Bid

9J-1 Ferric Tank Cleanings Blend Existing Ferrric Atwater WWTP unit No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $2,500.00 No Bid No Bid

Ferric Tank Cleanings Blend Existing Ferrric Atwater WWTP total No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $2,500.00 No Bid No Bid

10 Calcium Hypochorite powder 100 lb drums unit No Bid No Bid No Bid $160.00 $162.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Calcium Hypochorite powder 100 lb drums total No Bid No Bid No Bid $4,800.00 $4,860.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Calcium Hypochorite powder StreetsboroFacility WWTP unit No Bid No Bid $181.20 $160.00 $162.00 $199.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Calcium Hypochorite powder Streetsboro Facility WWTP total No Bid No Bid $2,718.00 $2,400.00 $2,430.00 $2,985.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Calcium Hypochorite powder O&M Facility WWTP unit No Bid No Bid $181.20 No Bid $162.00 $199.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Calcium Hypochorite powder O&M Facility WWTP total No Bid No Bid $2,718.00 No Bid $2,430.00 $2,985.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid

11A Sodium Hydroxide 25% Shalersville WTP 30 loads 2000 Gal bulk unit No Bid No Bid $2,840.00 $1.19 gal $3,130.00/$1.56 gal $1.15 gal No Bid No Bid No Bid

Sodium Hydroxide 25% Shalersville WTP 30 loads 2000 Gal bulk total No Bid No Bid $96,560.00 $80,920.00 $106,420.00 $78,200.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid

11B Sodium Hydroxide 4,000 gal Franklin Hills WWTP unit No Bid No Bid $4,136.00 0.89 gal $4,520.00 $1.13 gal No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Sodium Hydroxide 4,000 gal Franklin Hills WWTP total No Bid No Bid $62,040.00 $53,400.00 $67,800.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
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11C Sodium Hydroxide 55 gal Franklin Hills WWTP unit No Bid No Bid $69.30 No Bid $74.75/ .13 lb $136.85 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Sodium Hydroxide 55 gal Franklin Hills WWTP total No Bid No Bid $8,316.00 No Bid $8,970.00 $16,422.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid

11D Sodium Hydroxide 15 gal Carboy O & M Facility unit No Bid No Bid $23.40 No Bid 24.80/ .155 lb No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Sodium Hydroxide 15 gal Carboy O & M Facility total No Bid No Bid $351.00 No Bid $372.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

12 Orthophosphate 30 gal drum unit No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $144.15/.4215 lb No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Orthophosphate 30 gal drum total No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $8,649.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Orthophosphate Shalersville  WTP unit No Bid No Bid $162.90 No Bid $144.15 No Bid No Bid No Bid $144.54

Orthophosphate Shalersville WTP total No Bid No Bid $6,516.00 No Bid $5,766.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $5,781.60

Orthophosphate& Brimfield WTP unit No Bid No Bid $162.90 No Bid $144.15 No Bid No Bid No Bid $144.54

Orthophosphate Brimfield  WTP total No Bid No Bid $3,258.00 No Bid $2,883.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $2,890.80

13 Polymer for Centrisys Centrifuge & Andritz Belts Press Streetsboro WWTP dry cwt No Bid 1,835.40$      No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Polymer for Centrisys Centrifuge & Andritz Belts Press Streetsboro WWTP dry total No Bid 40,378.80$    No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

9A Bonded - $438.00/ Dry Ton x 46,000 lb Mininimum Bulk Delivery 

9C1 Bonded - $450.00/ Dry Ton x46,000 lb minimimum Bulk Delivery that includes 3 stops total 

9C2 Bonded - $450.00/ Dry Ton x46,000 lb minimimum Bulk Delivery that includes 3 stops total 

9C3 Bonded - $450.00/ Dry Ton x46,000 lb minimimum Bulk Delivery that includes 3 stops total 


